
7 Perfect Strategies to Score High in Your Aqa
Gcse Religious Studies Exam

Are you looking for effective ways to excel in your Aqa Gcse Religious Studies
exam? Look no further! In this article, we will provide you with 7 incredible
strategies to help you score high in your exam. From studying smart to practicing
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with past papers, we have got you covered. Read on to discover the secrets to
achieving success in your Aqa Gcse Religious Studies exam.

1. Understand the Exam Format

Before diving into the study material, it is crucial to familiarize yourself with the
exam format. The Aqa Gcse Religious Studies exam consists of multiple-choice,
short answer, and essay questions. Take a look at past papers and mark
schemes to get a clear idea of what to expect. This will allow you to tailor your
study plan accordingly.
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2. Create a Study Schedule

One of the keys to exam success is effective time management. Create a study
schedule that allows you to cover all the necessary topics without overwhelming
yourself. Divide your study time equally among different areas of the syllabus and
allocate dedicated time for revision as well.

3. Utilize Resources

Make use of relevant resources to enhance your understanding of the subject.
Consult your textbook, supplementary notes, and online resources to gather

FREE

http://dl.neutronbyte.com/pdf-file/Wa18oYTP/e/wjkK/OPMw/XPbag/AQA-GCSE-Religious-Studies-A-9-1-Christianity-and-Islam-Revision-Guide-GCSE-Religious-Studies-for-AQA.pdf
http://dl.neutronbyte.com/pdf-file/Wa18oYTP/e/wjkK/OPMw/XPbag/AQA-GCSE-Religious-Studies-A-9-1-Christianity-and-Islam-Revision-Guide-GCSE-Religious-Studies-for-AQA.pdf
http://dl.neutronbyte.com/pdf-file/Wa18oYTP/e/wjkK/OPMw/XPbag/AQA-GCSE-Religious-Studies-A-9-1-Christianity-and-Islam-Revision-Guide-GCSE-Religious-Studies-for-AQA.pdf


information. Additionally, watch informative videos, listen to podcasts, or join
online discussion forums to broaden your knowledge. The more resources you
utilize, the better your grasp on the subject matter will be.

4. Practice Past Papers

Practicing with past papers is an excellent way to simulate the exam environment
and evaluate your progress. Solve past papers within the allocated time and refer
to the mark schemes to identify areas where you need improvement. This
practice will not only help you become familiar with the type of questions asked
but also build your confidence.

5. Revise and Review

Revision is a crucial part of exam preparation. After covering all the topics,
allocate dedicated time for revision. Make concise notes summarizing the key
points for each topic. Review these notes regularly and test yourself on the
important concepts. Consider revising in a group to engage in discussions and
gain different perspectives.

6. Seek Guidance

If you find certain concepts challenging or need clarification on certain topics, do
not hesitate to seek guidance. Reach out to your teacher, classmates, or even
online tutors who specialize in Aqa Gcse Religious Studies. Discussing your
doubts and receiving expert advice will significantly improve your understanding
of the subject.

7. Stay Calm and Confident

On the day of the exam, it is essential to stay calm and confident. Take deep
breaths, remind yourself of your preparation, and trust in your abilities. Read each
question carefully before answering and manage your time effectively. Do not



rush through the paper; maintain a steady pace and answer to the best of your
knowledge.

Achieving success in your Aqa Gcse Religious Studies exam is not an impossible
task. By understanding the exam format, creating a study schedule, utilizing
resources, practicing past papers, revising effectively, seeking guidance, and
staying calm on the exam day, you can confidently tackle any question that
comes your way. Remember, preparation is the key to success, and with these
strategies, you are well on your way to acing your Aqa Gcse Religious Studies
exam!
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Building on the Oxford AQA GCSE Religious Studies Student Books, this
Revision Guide offers a structured approach to revising for the new 9-1 exams. 1.
RECAP: key content from the Student Book is condensed and re-presented in
simple visual styles to make content memorable and help retention. 2. APPLY:
students actively apply the content they have just revised to build the knowledge
and evaluative skills needed for the exams. 3. REVIEW: regular opportunities to
practice exam questions and review answers direct students to pinpoint any
areas of weakness in knowledge or exam skills, identifying where they'll need to
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concentrate their efforts for further revision. This Revision Guide is ideal for
students combining Christianity and Islam. With all the
essential content condensed and made memorable, and plenty of exam practice,
tips and annotated sample answers, students can confidently prepare for their
new exams.
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