
Discover the Riveting Journey of "Something
Like Normal" by Trish Doller that Explores
Love and Healing
Are you looking for an extraordinary novel that will captivate your heart and take
you on an emotional rollercoaster of love, loss, and healing? Look no further than
"Something Like Normal" by Trish Doller. In this article, we will delve into the
pages of this remarkable book, exploring its captivating plot, compelling
characters, and themes of resilience and redemption.

The Plot

At the heart of "Something Like Normal" lies the story of Travis Stephenson, a
young Marine who returns home to his small Florida town after serving in
Afghanistan. Battling his own personal demons and haunted by the death of his
best friend and fellow soldier, Travis struggles to readjust to civilian life.

As he tries to mend broken relationships, including the one with his estranged
father, Travis finds solace in reconnecting with Harper, his childhood best friend.
But their friendship takes a different turn as they navigate the complexities of their
past and present feelings for one another.
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The novel takes readers on a journey filled with unexpected twists and turns,
addressing important topics such as PTSD, survivor's guilt, and the lasting effects
of war.

The Characters

Trish Doller has crafted a cast of characters that feel incredibly authentic and
relatable. Travis Stephenson, the protagonist, is a complex and flawed individual,
making his struggles and growth all the more compelling. His emotional journey
of healing and redemption resonates deeply with readers.

Harper, the female lead, is a strong and independent character who adds depth
and vulnerability to the story. Her own personal challenges and resilience make
her an essential and powerful presence throughout the book.

Supporting characters such as Travis' father, mother, and fellow Marines are
crafted with great attention to detail and contribute significantly to the overall
narrative.

Themes Explored

One of the central themes in "Something Like Normal" is resilience. Doller
beautifully portrays how Travis, despite facing numerous challenges and
setbacks, finds the strength to rebuild his life and forge a new path.

The novel also explores the concepts of love and healing. Travis and Harper's
evolving relationship serves as a vehicle to explore the healing power of love and
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how it can bring hope and redemption even in the darkest of times.

Additionally, the book sheds light on the often-overlooked challenges faced by
veterans returning from war zones. Through Travis' character, readers gain a
deeper understanding of the struggles these brave individuals face and the
importance of providing support and understanding.

Achievements and Reception

"Something Like Normal" has garnered widespread acclaim since its publication.
It has been praised for its authentic portrayal of military life and its exploration of
the aftermath of war. Trish Doller's powerful storytelling has struck a chord with
readers, who have found themselves emotionally invested in the characters and
their journeys.

This heart-wrenching yet hopeful novel has touched the lives of many, earning it a
dedicated fanbase and numerous positive reviews.

In , "Something Like Normal" by Trish Doller is a must-read for anyone seeking a
powerful and emotionally-charged story. Through its compelling plot, well-
developed characters, and exploration of important themes, the book offers a
profound reading experience that will stay with you long after you turn the final
page.

So, grab a copy of "Something Like Normal" and embark on an unforgettable
journey into the hearts of Travis and Harper as they navigate the tumultuous path
towards healing, love, and self-discovery.
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When Travis returns home from Afghanistan, his parents are splitting up, his
brother's stolen his girlfriend and car, and the nightmares of his best friend getting
killed keep him completely spooked. But when he runs into Harper, a girl who
despises him for rumors Travis started back in middle school, life actually starts
looking up. And as he and Harper see more of each other, he falls deeper in love
with her and begins to find his way through the family meltdown, the post-
traumatic stress and the possibility of a interesting future. His sense of humor,
sense of his own strength and incredible sense of honor make Travis an
irresistible and eminently loveable hero in this fantastic and timely debut novel.
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