
Kemps Nine Daies Wonder: A Journey of
Dance from London to Norwich

Kemps Nine Daies Wonder Performed In Daunce From London To Norwich is a
fascinating historical event that took place in England in the late 16th century.
This article explores the captivating story of Kemp's nine-day journey on foot from

http://dl.neutronbyte.com/pdf-file/Wa18oYTP/e/wjkK/OPMw/lamBy/Kemps-Nine-Daies-Wonder-Performed-in-a-Daunce-from-London-to-Norwich.pdf


London to Norwich, entertaining people with his lively dance performances along
the way.

Who was Kemp and What was "Nine Daies Wonder"?

William Kemp was a renowned actor and dancer during the Elizabethan era. He
was a member of the Lord Chamberlain's Men, one of the most prominent acting
troupes of the time. In 1600, Kemp embarked on a unique challenge called "Nine
Daies Wonder," where he aimed to dance from London to Norwich, a distance of
approximately 80 miles.
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Kemp's endeavor attracted a lot of attention as he set out on his journey,
accompanied by a small group of musicians. The daunce, as it was called,
involved a combination of vigorous dancing, singing, and playing musical
instruments. It was a true spectacle that captivated the people of Elizabethan
England.

The Journey of Dance

Kemp started his epic journey on February 25, 1599, from the churchyard of St.
Mary's, in Aldermanbury, London. He danced his way through various towns and
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villages, drawing large crowds and creating a celebratory atmosphere wherever
he went.

The dance itself was a tremendous physical feat, requiring stamina, skill, and
creativity. Kemp showcased his extraordinary talents, incorporating intricate
footwork, acrobatic moves, and humorous gestures into his performance. His
lively dancing style brought joy and entertainment to everyone who witnessed it.
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“"Kemp danced his way into the hearts of the people, leaving a trail
of laughter and amazement behind him."”

During his nine-day journey, Kemp took pauses to rest and interact with the
locals. His charismatic personality and friendly demeanor made him a favorite
among the people. Residents of the towns and villages along the route were
excited to be a part of the unique event, sharing their enthusiasm, food, and
hospitality with the traveling dancer.

The Impact and Legacy

Kemps Nine Daies Wonder had a lasting impact on both Kemp's career and the
history of dance. The event not only established Kemp as an accomplished
dancer but also elevated his fame as a celebrated performer. Kemp's successful
feat of dancing for nine consecutive days remains a remarkable achievement in
the annals of dance history.

The journey also contributed to the popularity of dance as a form of entertainment
during the Elizabethan era. It highlighted the power of dance to bring people
together and create a sense of joy and unity in the community. Kemp's
performance uplifted spirits and provided a temporary escape from the hardships
of daily life.



Furthermore, Kemps Nine Daies Wonder is believed to have inspired other
performers to undertake similar challenges, striving to entertain and amaze
audiences with their talents. The event paved the way for the evolution of dance
as an art form, creating new possibilities and pushing boundaries.

The End of the Journey
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On March 5, 1599, Kemp triumphantly arrived in Norwich, marking the end of his
extraordinary journey. He had successfully completed his mission, dancing his
way into the hearts of the people and etching his name in history.

Although the exact details of Kemp's performances during the Nine Daies
Wonder are lost to time, the legacy and impact of his journey continue to intrigue
and inspire dance enthusiasts and historians alike.

So next time you find yourself fascinated by a dance performance, remember
William Kemp and the incredible journey he embarked upon, bringing joy and
wonder to England as he danced his way from London to Norwich.
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