
Tarzan And The Jewels Of Opar - The Hidden
Treasure Adventure
When it comes to adventure and excitement, few literary characters compare to
Tarzan. Created by Edgar Rice Burroughs, Tarzan is a classic hero known for his
incredible strength, agility, and ability to communicate with animals. One of
Tarzan’s most thrilling adventures is showcased in the novel "Tarzan And The
Jewels Of Opar". In this article, we will delve into the captivating world of Tarzan
as he embarks on a quest to find the hidden treasure known as the Jewels of
Opar.

The Legend of Opar

The story revolves around the legendary lost city of Opar, which supposedly
dates back to ancient times. Opar is said to have been a prosperous empire
located deep in the heart of Africa. It was known for its immense wealth,
particularly its collection of precious jewels. Over time, Opar fell into obscurity and
was eventually forgotten by most, except for its guardians, the high priests and
priestesses.

According to the legend, the Jewels of Opar were considered sacred and
possessed magical powers. These jewels had the ability to grant great fortune
and even eternal life to whoever possessed them. Understandably, the treasure
became the ultimate desire of many, including Tarzan’s arch-nemesis, the
ruthless Belgian mercenary, Captain Leon Rom.
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Tarzan’s Adventure Begins

Tarzan's journey commences as he hears about the existence of the Jewels of
Opar. Intrigued by the legend, he decides to embark on a perilous expedition to
find the hidden treasure. His mission is not only driven by the curiosity to witness
the magnificence of Opar but also to ensure that the jewels do not fall into the
wrong hands.

Accompanied by his loyal friends and allies, including his wife Jane and a group
of native warriors, Tarzan ventures deep into the heart of Africa, facing numerous
challenges and dangers along the way. He encounters wild animals, treacherous
terrain, and even rival treasure hunters who seek to claim the Jewels of Opar for
themselves.

The Mysteries of Opar

As Tarzan delves further into the heart of Opar, he unravels a series of mysteries
surrounding the lost city. He discovers intricate temples adorned with ancient
hieroglyphs and artefacts that provide clues to the whereabouts of the jewel-
laden treasury. The high priests and priestesses of Opar, who guard the treasures
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zealously, do not take kindly to the intrusion of outsiders, making Tarzan's
adventure even more thrilling and dangerous.

The Final Confrontation

After enduring countless obstacles and overcoming numerous adversaries,
Tarzan finally arrives at the treasure chamber deep within the crumbling ruins of
Opar. As he gazes upon the dazzling display of jewels, he realizes the true power
they possess and the danger they could potentially unleash if they ever fell into
the wrong hands.

Just as he is about to secure the Jewels of Opar, Captain Leon Rom appears,
driven by his insatiable greed. A fierce battle ensues between the two
adversaries, a battle that not only tests Tarzan's physical strength but also his
strategic wit. Ultimately, Tarzan emerges victorious, foiling Rom's plans and
safeguarding the Jewels of Opar from falling into the hands of evildoers.

The Legacy of "Tarzan And The Jewels Of Opar"

"Tarzan And The Jewels Of Opar" not only offers an enthralling adventure story
but also explores deeper themes such as greed, power, and the importance of
protecting cherished treasures. It showcases Tarzan's unwavering bravery and
determination as he fights to preserve the sanctity and integrity of Opar.

Although the Jewels of Opar remain secure at the end of the novel, the allure of
hidden treasures and ancient civilizations continues to captivate readers'
imaginations. Tarzan's thrilling journey through treacherous jungles and ancient
ruins serves as a reminder of our inherent fascination with the unknown and the
endless possibilities that await those who dare to venture into the unexplored.



"Tarzan And The Jewels Of Opar" is an unforgettable adventure that takes
readers on a journey through the depths of Africa in search of hidden treasure.
Edgar Rice Burroughs' vivid storytelling and compelling characters make this
novel a must-read for all adventure enthusiasts. Whether you are a longtime
Tarzan fan or new to his world, this tale is sure to keep you on the edge of your
seat, eagerly flipping through the pages to discover the fate of the Jewels of Opar
and the fate of our beloved hero, Tarzan.
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Tarzan sets out in search of treasure—only to lose his memory—in this thrilling
adventure novel in the original Tarzan series.

When Tarzan returns to Opar to claim its lost treasure, he knows he must once
again confront the beautiful and vengeful Oparian high priestess, La. But he will
soon discover that even more dangers await him: Following his trail to the lost city
is Belgian criminal Albert Werper. And when they are all caught in an earthquake,
a blow to the head leaves Tarzan with amnesia.
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With no memory of his former life—or the worth of the “pretty pebbles” he has
collected—Tarzan joins with Werper in escaping from La. Meanwhile, Werper’s
partner kidnaps Jane. Even as she executes her own daring escape, her life will
be in danger unless Tarzan recovers his true identity.
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