
The Ultimate Guide on How to Buy the Right
Plane and Teach Yourself to Fly
Flying a plane is an exhilarating experience that allows you to see the world from
a whole new perspective. The freedom and excitement of being up in the air can
be truly incredible. If you have ever dreamt of becoming a pilot and owning your
own plane, this article is for you. In this guide, you will find valuable information
and step-by-step instructions on how to buy the right plane and teach yourself to
fly.

Step 1: Research and Education

Before embarking on your journey to becoming a pilot, it is important to gather as
much information as possible. Educate yourself about different types of planes,
their maintenance requirements, and the costs associated with owning and
operating one. Join online aviation forums, read books, and attend aviation
events to connect with experienced pilots who can provide guidance.

Step 2: Determine Your Flying Goals

Understanding your flying goals will help you narrow down the right type of plane
to purchase. Are you interested in long-distance travel, aerobatics, or recreational
flying? Knowing this will help you choose the right plane that aligns with your
objectives.
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Step 3: Budgeting and Financing

Buying a plane can be a significant financial investment, so careful budgeting is
essential. Consider the cost of purchasing the plane, insurance, fuel expenses,
maintenance costs, and hangar fees. Additionally, research your financing options
to determine whether buying outright or obtaining a loan works best for you.

Step 4: Finding the Right Plane

Now that you have a budget in mind, it's time to find the right plane. Start by
exploring aviation classifieds, reputable dealerships, and online marketplaces.
Narrow down your options based on features, performance, and price. Consider
getting a pre-purchase inspection from a trusted mechanic to ensure the plane is
in good condition.

Step 5: Learning to Fly Solo

Teaching yourself to fly a plane requires dedication, discipline, and a thirst for
knowledge. Begin by finding a flight school in your area that offers self-guided
training programs. Study the FAA pilot's handbook, take online courses, and
practice extensively using flight simulators to enhance your skills before taking to
the air.
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Step 6: Flight Training and Certification

While self-teaching can provide a solid foundation, it is important to receive
formal flight training and certification. Enroll in a flight school that offers
comprehensive flight training courses. These courses cover topics such as
aviation regulations, emergency procedures, navigation, and more. Passing the
necessary exams will earn you your pilot's license.

Step 7: Maintenance and Safety

As a plane owner, it is crucial to prioritize maintenance and safety. Regularly
inspect your aircraft, perform routine maintenance checks, and stay up-to-date
with any manufacturer recommendations. Join the Aircraft Owners and Pilots
Association (AOPA) and connect with other pilots to stay informed about the
latest safety practices and regulations.

Embarking on the journey of buying the right plane and teaching yourself to fly is
an exciting adventure. With thorough research, careful planning, and a
commitment to learning, you can make your dream of owning a plane and flying it
a reality. Remember, safety should always be your top priority, so never hesitate
to seek professional training and guidance. So, take the leap, spread your wings,
and soar through the sky with confidence!
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It’s a lot easier to fly RC planes now than it used to be. There’s been a revolution,
thanks to the miniaturization and lower cost of tiny electronics and rechargeable
batteries. These days you can buy a ready-to-fly plane, charge the battery, and
be in the air within an hour. And that’s part of the problem. Now it’s so easy to get
into the air, you can get there long before you’re ready.

No matter how smart they are, thousands of people every year jump into the RC
plane hobby, and many repeat the same mistakes. The most common mistakes
are:

Buying the wrong plane. Lots of folks get into the RC plane hobby by buying a
Porsche when they should have bought a Chevy. You’ve got to buy a plane that
matches your skill level – one that can fly slowly until you’ve learned to control the
plane. You need a durable plane that can withstand several hard landings without
cracking into pieces. Luckily, many of the inexpensive planes I’ll recommend in
this book are also the most durable.

Wasting money on the wrong accessories, and not getting the right accessories.
New hobbyists face a bewildering array of parts and accessories. For example,
do you need extra batteries? What kind of batteries? Do you need a battery
charger? Which one? What kind of transmitter do you need? Can you use your
existing transmitter with your future planes?

Being impatient. In my first three months in the RC plane hobby, I lost and
crashed more than a dozen planes, simply because I wasn’t properly prepared
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and didn’t exercise patience—like trying to fly during bad weather. I will show you
how to prepare yourself for the best chance at success.

Having no plan for takeoffs, flying, and landing before you leave home. We’ll go
over the basics of piloting a model plane, and how to do it safely while having fun.
Don’t wait until you have a plane in the air before you start learning. Start now. I’ll
give simple instructions on how to take off, fly and land while keeping your risks
of accident and injury as low as possible.

Through trial and error, I’ve discovered which planes are the best for novice RC
pilots. There are dozens of choices, but relatively few have earned a place in this
book. I’ve purchased and flown all of the planes mentioned here (along with other
planes that didn’t make it into this book). My recommendations are based solely
on how the planes perform, the quality of the materials, and the manufacturer’s
customer support.
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