
The Untold Story of the Wars that Divided
Alexander the Great’s Successors
The legacy of Alexander the Great, one of history's greatest conquerors, is well-
known. However, what many people overlook are the tumultuous wars that
erupted after his death, dividing his vast empire among his successors. In this
article, we delve into the historical accounts and unravel the gripping tale of
power struggles, betrayals, and conquests that unfolded in the wake of
Alexander's demise.

The Death of Alexander the Great

The year was 323 BCE, and after years of relentless military campaigns,
Alexander the Great breathed his last in Babylon, leaving his empire vulnerable
and his loyal generals jostling for control. The question of who would inherit his
vast lands sent shockwaves across the ancient world, setting the stage for a
series of epic power struggles.

The Rise of the Successors

Among the many generals vying for power, three individuals rose to prominence:
Ptolemy, Seleucus, and Antigonus. Ptolemy, a loyal friend and skillful
commander, took control of Egypt and established the famous Ptolemaic dynasty,
which would go on to flourish for centuries.
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Seleucus, known for his meticulous administrative skills, carved out a vast empire
stretching from present-day Iran to Afghanistan. The Seleucid Empire became
known for its cultural richness, blending Greek and Persian influences.

Antigonus, a seasoned military commander and cunning strategist, sought to
unify Alexander's empire under his own leadership. However, his dreams of
consolidating power were soon shattered by other ambitious generals.

The Wars that Shaped History

The Wars of the Diadochi, as the power struggles were collectively known, were
marked by bloodshed, shifting alliances, and intense rivalries. Each general
sought to expand their territories, creating a chaotic landscape fraught with
political intrigues and military clashes.

The Battle of Ipsus

One of the pivotal battles during this period was the Battle of Ipsus in 301 BCE. It
pitted the forces of Antigonus against an alliance comprising of Seleucus,
Ptolemy, and Cassander. The outcome of this battle would determine the fate of
Alexander's empire.
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In a fiercely fought battle, Antigonus was ultimately defeated and killed. This
marked the end of his dream of uniting Alexander's empire. The victors emerged
as the dominant players in the power struggle, solidifying their positions in the
fragmented world that followed.

The Decline of the Seleucid Empire

While Ptolemy's dynasty thrived in Egypt, and the Greek city-states emerged as
power centers in the Mediterranean under the leadership of Cassander, the
Seleucid Empire faced numerous challenges. The vastness of the empire made it
difficult to maintain control, and internal strife further weakened its hold over the
territories.

Rise of Rome and the Legacy of Alexander

As the successors fought amongst themselves, a rising power in the West was
observing their struggles with interest. Rome, under the leadership of ambitious
generals and politicians, began expanding its influence in the Mediterranean,
eventually turning its gaze towards the lands once ruled by Alexander.

The clash between Rome and the successor states would shape the future of the
ancient world. Rome's military might and political acumen eventually led to the
demise of the Greek kingdoms, thereby bringing an end to the era ushered in by
Alexander the Great.

The history of Alexander the Great's successors is a tale filled with grand
ambitions, treachery, and the relentless pursuit of power. The Wars of the
Diadochi that ensued after his death forever changed the course of history,
setting the stage for the rise and fall of empires that followed. The legacy of
Alexander, however, lives on as a testament to the transformative power of
conquest and the fragility of human ambition.
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In 323 BCE, Alexander the Great was on top of the world. Never a man to sit on
his hands or rest upon his laurels, Alexander began planning his future
campaigns, which may have included attempts to subdue the Arabian Peninsula
or make another incursion into India. But fate had other plans for the young
Macedonian king. One night, while feasting with his admiral Nearchus, he drank
too much and took to bed with a fever. At first, it seemed like the fever was merely
a consequence of his excess, and there was not much concern for his health, but
when a week had elapsed and there was still no sign of his getting better, his
friends and generals began to grow concerned. The fever grew, consuming him
to the point that he could barely speak. After two weeks, on June 11, 323 B.C.,
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Alexander the Great, King of Macedon, Hegemon of the League of Corinth, King
of Kings, died.

On his deathbed, some historians claim that when he was pressed to name a
successor, Alexander muttered that his empire should go “to the strongest”. Other
sources claim that he passed his signet ring to his general Perdiccas, thereby
naming him successor, but whatever his choices were or may have been, they
were ignored. Alexander’s generals, all of them with the loyalty of their own corps
at their backs, would tear each other apart in a vicious internal struggle that
lasted almost half a century before four factions emerged victorious: Macedonia,
the Seleucid Empire in the east, the Kingdom of Pergamon in Asia Minor, and the
Ptolemaic dynasty in Egypt. During the course of these wars, Alexander’s only
heir, the posthumously born Alexander IV, was murdered, extinguishing his
bloodline for ever.

Although it was an incredibly important period in world history, it is sometimes as
confusing as it is frustrating for historians because the allegiances of the generals
changed constantly and historical sources are often biased in some regards and
utterly lacking in others. Although none of these men were able to replicate
Alexander the Great’s territorial success, a few carved out sizable empires and
were able to establish long-lasting political dynasties. Ptolemy I brought Egypt
back to a central position of power in the region, and Seleucus I built a strong
empire on the ruins of ancient Babylonia, but other generals, such as Perdiccas,
were killed early on in the fighting and slipped into relative obscurity.

Some of the Macedonian generals had a significant impact on the region during
their lifetimes, but they left no heirs to carry on their political memories. The
general Lysimachus won control of Thrace and established a fairly important
kingdom in that land, but when he died his successors all turned on and killed



each other, effectively ending any potential dynasty. Similarly, Cassander was a
Macedonian general who was involved in the Diadochi Wars, and for a time it
looked like he was going to be the biggest winner among the Macedonians.
Cassander became the king of Macedon, had direct influence over most of
southern Greece, and was courted by the other kings and generals in their
conflicts against each other.

The Diadochi: The History of Alexander the Great’s Successors and the Wars that
Divided His Empire chronicles how Alexander’s legendary conquests shaped the
next several centuries, and how the successor generals carved out various
empires. Along with pictures depicting important people, places, and events, you
will learn about the Diadochi like never before.
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